

**CITY OF LIMA, OHIO  
VEHICLE MAINTENANCE BID  
JANUARY 1, 2021 THRU DECEMBER 31, 2023**

BID OPENING: October 28, 2020

Reineke Lincoln Inc.  
1360 Greely Chapel Road  
Lima, Ohio 45804

Miller Auto, Inc.  
19505 Harrod Rd.  
Lima, Ohio 45806

**PRICES QUOTED ARE FOR ALL MAKES AND MODELS**

1. Air Conditioning Maintenance: Includes A/C diagnostics tighten belt and leak check system	\$49.95	\$95.00
2. Brake Service		
A. Brake System Inspection:	\$10.00	\$0.00
B. Front Includes turning rotors and replacing pads (OEM)	\$149.99	\$175.00
Brakes: When replacing rotors and replacing pads (OEM)	\$274.99	\$275.00
C. Rear Includes turning rotors and replacing pads (OEM)	\$149.99	\$175.00
Brakes: When replacing rotors and replacing pads (OEM)	\$274.99	\$275.00
When replacing drums and shoes (OEM)	\$331.99	\$275.00
3. Cooling System Maintenance: Includes draining and refilling radiator and engine block to manufacturer's specifications	\$79.95	\$140.00
4. Vehicle Diagnostics: Includes complete engine diagnostics of ignition emission and fuel system (Parts Extra)	\$50.00	\$50.00
5. Fuel Injection and Induction Cleaning: Includes mechanically cleaning fuel injectors and cleaning induction system.	\$129.99	\$100.00
6. Rear Differential Service: w/75/140 Synthetic	\$179.99	\$125.00
7. Oil Change: Including oil, lube and filter, tire rotation, safety inspection, top off all fluid levels, and adjust tire pressure	\$20.99	\$45.00
8. 30-60-90K Service (To include oil change, transmission flush, air filter Fuel filter and coolant flush)	\$289.99	\$350.00
9. Parts: Your lowest parts cost plus percentage of markup (Subject to verification)	25.00%	20.00%
10. Labor: Flat rate per hour	\$50.00	\$95.00
11. Power Steering Flush:	\$69.95	\$95.00
12. Tire Change	\$9.99	No Bid
13. Tire Alignment: Includes complete 4-wheel thrust angle alignment 2-wheel alignment	\$59.95	\$85.00
14. Mount & Balance Tires (per tire cost)	\$34.99	No Bid
15. Tire Disposal Fee (per tire cost)	\$9.99	No Bid
16. Rotate Only (per tire cost)	\$2.50	\$2.00
17. Rotate and Balance (per tire cost)	\$3.00	\$3.00
18. Tire Repairs (patched from inside of tire)	\$8.99	\$10.00
19. Valve Stems (per tire cost)	\$9.99	\$15.00
20. Wheel Balance Only (per tire cost)	\$10.56	No Bid
21. Wheel Weights (per tire cost)	\$8.99	\$10.00
22. Transmission Maintenance: Includes flushing transmission, torque	\$0.00	\$0.00
	\$129.95	\$150.00

**CITY OF LIMA, OHIO  
 VEHICLE MAINTENANCE BID  
 JANUARY 1, 2021 THRU DECEMBER 31, 2023**

BID OPENING: October 28, 2020

	Reineke Lincoln Inc. 1360 Greely Chapel Road Lima, Ohio 45804	Miller Auto, Inc. 19505 Harrod Rd. Lima, Ohio 45806
converter and completely refilling to manufacturer's specs		
23. Tune-up	\$399.00	No Bid
PICK-UP AND DELIVERY	NO CHARGE	\$25.00 Round Trip
COST INCREASE FOR 2ND YEAR OF CONTRACT (IF ANY)	NO INCREASE	NO INCREASE
COST INCREASE FOR 3RD YEAR OF CONTRACT (IF ANY)	NO INCREASE	NO INCREASE
WARRANTY		
PLEASE INDICATE WARRANTY ON LABOR	FORD - 2 YEARS UNLIMITED MILES	1 YEAR
PARTS	FORD - 2 YEARS UNLIMITED MILES ALL OTHER MAKES 12 MONTHS 12,000 MILES	6 MONTH OR SAME AS MANUFACTURER OFFERS